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Resolution No. 49-25

The Logan County Board of Commissioners met in regular open session on this date of March 4, 2025 with
Commissioner Yoder and Commissioner Fitzpatrick present.

Mr. Michael E. Yoder moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RE: AMEND RESOLUTION 23-25 CORRECTED BID RESULTS AWARD BID TO R.D.

HOLDER OIL CO., INC.- PREMIUM ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL FUEL-LOGAN
COUNTY ENGINEER

WHEREAS, bids were received on January 23, 2025 for premium ultra sulfur diesel fuel, and
WHEREAS, bids were received by Sunrise Cooperative, Inc. and R.D. Holder Oil Co., and

WHEREAS, all bids have been reviewed by the Logan County Engineer and a recommendation has been made to

accept the bid of R.D. Holder Oil Company, Inc., 600 N. Dayton Lakeview Road, New Carlisle, Ohio 45344 in the
amount of $3.479 per gallon.

THEREFORE, BE IT HEREBY RESOLVED, by the Logan County Board of Commissioners to award the bid to

R.D. Holder Oil Company, Inc., 600 N. Dayton Lakeview Road, New Carlisle, Ohio 45344 in the amount of $3.479 per
gallon.

Mr. Greg Fitzpatrick seconded the motion.

Roll call resulted as follows:

Mr, ] chael E. Ydder, President

Mr. Joe Antram, Vice President

LS

itzpatrick, M¢mber /

I, De De Doss, Clerk/Administrator, hereby certify this to be a true copy of the proceedings as taken from the
minutes of the meeting of the Logan County Commissioners on this date of March 4, 2025.

Y 2%

De De Doss, Administrative Clerk
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Received

Logan County
Commissioners

Telephone: (937) 592-2791

APPROVED BY THE ROARD OF

LOGAN COUNTY COMGIS i nES O aan s out
MOTION %%

Fax: (937) 599-2658

The Honorable Board of - =
Logan County Commissioners 2ND X

117 E. Columbus Avenue, Suite 100 PER RESOLUTION # ,L _
Bellefontaine, OH 43311 DATED Aldas

Re: Resolution No. 23-25

Corrected bid results for Premium Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel

After further review of the received bid for premium ultra-low sulfur diesel fuel from Sunrise
Cooperative, Inc., 2025 W. State Street, P.O. Box 870, Fremont, Ohio 43420, it has come to my
attention that the bid price of $3.435 per unit for Premium Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel adopted
in Resolution No. 23-25 was the incorrect bid amount because it did not include state tax. The
correct bid amount including state tax was $3.905 per unit. This results in RD Holder being the
actual low bid for Premium Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel with a firm bid price including state tax of

$3.479.
Company Price per Gal. Price per Gal. Meeisgpecs.
Reg. Diesel BS
. 3.479 .
R.D. Holder Oil Co. No Bid Yes
Sunrise Cooperative Inc. $3.905 No Bid Yes

Therefore, 1 am recommending that your honorable board amend Resolution No. 23-25 by
removing Sunrise Cooperative, Inc. as the winning low bid and awarding the bid to R.D. Holder
Oil Co., Inc., 600 N. Dayton Lakeview Rd. New Carlisle, Ohio 45344 for the firm bid price of

$3.479 per gallon.

In accordance with ORC 9.24, we have checked the Auditor of State’s Unresolved Findings for
Recovery Database and the federal system for awards management. R.D. Holder Oil Co. Inc.
was not listed and we have retained the certified search confirmation pages in the project file.

This will be paid from Auto and Gas Funds.
Respect ly su mltted
Scott C. Coéman PE., P.S.

Logan County Engmeer
SCC/sj



COMPETITIVE BIDDER'S
PERSONAL PROPERTY TAX AFFIDAVIT
LOGAN COUNTY, OHIO (R.C. 5719.042)

STATE OF OHIO:
188
LOGAN COUNTY:

The undersigned, being duly sworn, says that he is or represents a competitive bidder doing business in, or with
Logan County, Ohio, and that: (Check appropriate lines).
He is a sole proprietorship doing business under his own name,

He is a sole proprietorship doing business under the name of

He is a general partner of the partnership known as
i”__He s a duly authorized officer of the corporation named _ A1) Hovder oi\ ¢0.Tne
The business address of the bidder is IQQQ N Qﬁ,’}gﬂ laeviews A News Qorlisle

Ol Ygzuy ; Telephone __ 4237~ 987- 0045

The undersiguned further says that the bidder at the time of submitting his or its bid:
Y Was not charged with any delinquent personal taxes in Logan County, Ohio,

Was charged with delinquent personal property taxes as follows:

YEAR AMOUNT © PENALTY " INTEREST
20_. s . s 5
20 B $_ - $
20 s s $

Signed: 74’7//,7%2/ W&vﬁ’

Title: _ P of Fuel




STATE OF CHIO:
: 88
LOGAN COUNTY:

Before me, a notary, in and for said county, personally appeared

Aah bya Ll e (sole proprietor doing business under his own name)
(sole proprietor doing business under the name of _ A D Holder oul ey Tae )
(general partuer of the Paz:tnership known as )
(duly anthorized officer of the Corporation name ),

who acknowledged that he is authorized in the premises and that his signing of this instrument is
the free act and deed of himself or the organization which he represents. ©

In testimony whereof, I have hereunto subscribed my name and affixed my official seal at

/ ' ’ ; Ohic.), this / g day of | ééﬂ{{ﬁkﬁ / ,2 5225 .
. : p e‘\\\~\“;00LE. No ’74,«,),
@éf‘ﬁﬁd %ﬁ’/@ (%’24// S8 %

5 P , = (2] =
sl i3 XE
= - . -
COMMISSJONERS: ,- : ok Ve §
No delinquent taxes — file - 3 " ey
Delinquent taxes - sent to County Engineer %, “&xp pR\\,"Q" ~

Y4, & O o
Yy 74 F O‘r\\\\‘\‘
Y8344 530y W

Clerk



BASE BID

Logan County

Board of Commissioners

117 E. Columbus Avenue, Suite 100
Bellefontaine, OH 43311

Gentlemen:

We propose to furnish to the Board of County Commissioners of Logan County, Ohio, delivered as ordered to the
Logan County Highway Department, the following material:

AMOUNT ITEM
40,000 Gal. (more or Less 15%) Premium Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel (clear) $ 3.479¢C
UNIT PRICE
Specifications:

Cetane Number: 45 minimum: Cetane Number of Material Bid L \; v
PourPoint, °F: Winter -20°, Summer -10°: Pour Point of Material Bid - Winter — 'Lfé' Summer -. &
Cloud Point, °F: Winter -10°, Summer + 5°: Cloud Point of Material Bid - Winter_— { (> Summer +4
Sulfur, 15 ppm maximum: Sulfur Content of Material Bid - ISppa

Anti-Icer to be provided in deliveries made during the months of November through March.

All materials are subject to inspection and approval as to comphance with these specifications. The expense of testing
to be borne by Logan County. ‘

The contractor w1ll guarantee the removal and/or replacement of any sh1pment that does not meet the reqmrements of
these specificatioris. It is understood that the existing fuel contained within the departments tanks that is contaminated
by the fuel that does not comply with these specifications will also be replaced

Note The Logan County nghway Department ut111zes above ground fuel storage rather than underground Our
max1mum capacmes are 4000 gallons diesel and 2000 gallons gasolme -

Company: A1 Holder ol (0, Tnc
Address:_,00 N TDayten [oWeviewn @4 New carlisle OH 45344

By: M@ 2 423 i%

Title: _\/P o€ Foel iy | ‘

Phone Number to Place Orders: _ 431- 887.- 6045



BASE BID

Logan County

Board of Commissioners

117 E. Columbus Avenue, Suite 100
Bellefontaine, OH 43311

Gentlemen:

We propose to furnish to the Board of County Commissioners of Logan County, Ohio, delivered as ordered to the
Logan County Highway Department, the following material:

AMOUNT ITEM

40,000 Gal. (more or Less 15%) Premium Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel (clear) S 3 405 0
UNIT PRICE

Specifications: j , 1/ 3\5 /o 47JA/Z' //7/

L.
Cetane Number: 45 minimum: Cetane Number of Material Bid __ / g

Pour Point, °F: Winter -20°, Summer -10°: Pour Point of Material Bid - Winter ) Q" Summer / A

Cloud Point, °F: Winter -10°, Summer + 5°: Cloud Point of Material Bid - Winter Z Summer i

Sulfirr, 15 ppm maximum: Sulfur Content of Material Bid Z \ 5

Anti-Icer to be provided in deliveries made during the months of November through March.

All materials are subject to inspection and approval as to compliance with these specifications. The expense of testing
to be borne by Logan County.

The contractor will guarantee the removal and/or replacement of any shipment that does not meet the requirements of
these specifications. It is understood that the existing fuel contained within the departments tanks that is contaminated
by the fuel that does not comply with these specifications will also be replaced.

Note: The Logan County Highway Department utilizes above ground fuel storage rather than underground. Our
maximum capacities are 4000 gallo s diesel and 2000 gallons gasoline.

Company: ) ; t?_é_,"7l} e

Address: cz'{’ﬁﬁ L(A §>[/i/7‘z ».57L F);fﬂl/)'n 7[‘ &74/ 1%3%;20

By:

Title: 1@5/ ._ 1DLiLrt e s

Phone Number to Place Orders: .C/éﬁ *']3/ ’ﬁ 0?5 { 2"
- bl &-H55

L MW e %y 9 e g

i B L]
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Resolution No. 23-25

The Logan County Board of Commissioners met in regular open session on this date of January 30, 2025 with full
board present.

Mr. Joe Antram moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RE: AWARD BID TO SUNRISE COOPERATIVE, INC.- PREMIUM ULTRA LOW SULFUR
DIESEL FUEL-LOGAN COUNTY ENGINEER

WHEREAS, bids were received on January 23, 2025 for premium ultra sulfur diesel fuel, and
WHEREAS, bids were received by Sunrise Cooperative, Inc. and R.D. Holder Qil Co., and

WHEREAS, all bids have been reviewed by the Logan County Engineer and a recommendation has been made to
accept the bid of Sunrise Cooperative, Inc., 2025 W. State Street, P.O. Box 870, Fremont, Ohio 43420 in the amount of

$3.4350 per gallon.

THEREFORE, BE IT HEREBY RESOLVED, by the Logan County Board of Commissioners to award the bid to
Sunrise Cooperative, Inc., 2025 W. State Street, P.O. Box 870, Fremont, Chio 43420 in the amount of $3.4350 per gallon.

Mr., Greg Fitzpatrick seconded the motion.

Roll call resulted as follows:

6{4‘ ecdard & Gpdun? 5’5“!
Mr. Michael E. Y ¢tler, President

>
(\1‘%(&%, ( ﬁ;f\';—_ 1 22—

Mr. floe Antram; Vice President J

I, De De Doss, Clerk/Administrator, hereby certify this to be a true copy of the proceedings as taken from the
minutes of the meeting of the Logan County Commissioners on this date of January 30, 2025.

LUL0p o ppe

De De Doss, Administrative Clerk

——— o o o i
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Telephone: (937) 592-2791

LOGAN COUNTY ENGINEER Fax: (937) 599-2658
January 27, 2025
The Honorable Board of APPROVEN ™ ~apsenng
Logan County Commissioners W00 iy e,
117 E. Columbus Avenue, Suite 100 woron ) "

e 7

Bellefontaine, OH 43311

Re: Premium Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel
January 23, 2025 at 11:30 AM

Gentlemen:

- %

1]2:0155 !

AS A5

We have reviewed the bids for premium ultra-low sulfur diesel fuel. The bid appears to be in
order meeting all specifications. The bids were as follows:

Company Price per Gal. Price per Gal. | Meets Spgésjd_
Reg, Diesel BS
Sunrise Cooperative Inc. $3.4350 ~ No Bid Yes
R.D. Holder Oil Co. $3.4790 No Bid Yes

Therefore, ] am recommending that your honorable board adopt a resolution awarding the bid to
Sunrise Cooperative, Inc., 2025 W. State Street, P.O. Box 870, Fremont, Ohio 43420 for the firm

bid price of $3.4350 per gallon.

In accordance with ORC 9.24, we have checked the Auditor of State’s Unresolved Findings for
Recovery Database and the federal system for awards management. Sunrise Cooperative, Inc.
was not listed and we have retained the certified search confirmation pages in the project file.

This will be paid from Auto and Gas Funds.
Respectfully submitted,

At —

Scott C. Coleman, P.E., P.S.
Logan County Engineer

SCClsj
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